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Exploring Digital Design takes a multi-disciplinary look at digital design research where digital design is
embedded in a larger socio-cultural context. Working from socio-technical research areas such as
Participatory Design (PD), Computer Supported Cooperative Work (CSCW) and Human-Computer
Interaction (HCI), the book explores how humanities offer new insights into digital design, and discusses a
variety of digital design research practices, methods, and theoretical approaches spanning established
disciplinary borders. The aim of the book is to explore the diversity of contemporary digital design practices
in which commonly shared aspects are interpreted and integrated into different disciplinary and
interdisciplinary conversations. It is the conversations and explorations with humanities that further
distinguish this book within digital design research. Illustrated with real examples from digital design
research practices from a variety of research projects and from a broad range of contexts Exploring Digital
Design offers a basis for understanding the disciplinary roots as well as the interdisciplinary dialogues in
digital design research, providing theoretical, empirical, and methodological sources for understanding
digital design research. The first half of the book Exploring Digital Design is authored as a multi-disciplinary
approach to digital design research, and represents novel perspectives and analyses in this research. The
contributors are Gunnar Liestøl, Andrew Morrison and Christina Mörtberg in addition to the editors.
Although primarily written for researchers and graduate students, digital design practioners will also find the
book useful. Overall, Exploring Digital Design provides an excellent introduction to, and resource for,
research into digital design.
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From reader reviews:

Albert Aucoin:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold
on guys this specific aren't like that. This Exploring Digital Design: Multi-Disciplinary Design Practices
(Computer Supported Cooperative Work) book is readable by you who hate those perfect word style. You
will find the information here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving even decrease the
knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer connected with Exploring Digital Design: Multi-Disciplinary
Design Practices (Computer Supported Cooperative Work) content conveys prospect easily to understand by
many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different in the form of it.
So , do you continue to thinking Exploring Digital Design: Multi-Disciplinary Design Practices (Computer
Supported Cooperative Work) is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Lillie Moreland:

Often the book Exploring Digital Design: Multi-Disciplinary Design Practices (Computer Supported
Cooperative Work) will bring you to the new experience of reading the book. The author style to elucidate
the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to read, this book very suited to you. The book
Exploring Digital Design: Multi-Disciplinary Design Practices (Computer Supported Cooperative Work) is
much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can
more easily to read the book.

Barbara Norwood:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Exploring Digital Design: Multi-
Disciplinary Design Practices (Computer Supported Cooperative Work), you could enjoy both. It is fine
combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout
fellas. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

James Esparza:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to choose book
like comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping Exploring Digital Design:
Multi-Disciplinary Design Practices (Computer Supported Cooperative Work) that give your pleasure
preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the
opportunity for people to know world far better then how they react towards the world. It can't be stated
constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to become
success person. So , for all of you who want to start examining as your good habit, you could pick Exploring



Digital Design: Multi-Disciplinary Design Practices (Computer Supported Cooperative Work) become your
personal starter.
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