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Elvis Costello is undoubtedly one of the most important and challenging musicians of the last thirty years.
Complicated Shadows paints a detailed portrait of an intensely private, complex, and creatively restless
individual. It draws on a wealth of new research, including exclusive interviews with people from all stages
of Costello's life and career: classmates, friends, members of his early bands, former lovers, members of the
Attractions, producers, and various collaborators. Complicated Shadows reveals the circumstances
surrounding his marriages to ex-Pogues bassist Cait O'Riordan and jazz singer Diana Krall, and the bitter
breakup of his long-term backing band, the Attractions. Costello's "coiled tight" personality and penchant for
outrageous candor set the tone for a frenetic, and aesthetically inventive, independent band. Their
independence is epitomized by their infamous 1977 Saturday Night Live appearance (replacing the Sex
Pistols, who dropped out) when Costello cut short the scheduled song, "Less Than Zero," then directed the
band to play the as-of-yet unreleased "Radio Radio." Costello didn't appear on live U.S. television again until
the 1980s. Complicated Shadows contains a full examination and analysis of the entirety of Costello's vast
and varied musical output, both in the studio and on the stage.
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From reader reviews:

James Ames:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be up-date about what going on or info even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move forward. Some
of you maybe will certainly update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but
the problems coming to an individual is you don't know which you should start with. This Complicated
Shadows: The Life and Music of Elvis Costello is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world.
Why, since this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Betty Bobbitt:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try and and must have the extra time or they will get lots of
stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do
you have when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then
do you try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the particular book
you have read is definitely Complicated Shadows: The Life and Music of Elvis Costello.

Nicole Montes:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book in comparison with can
satisfy your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that need more time to be
read. Complicated Shadows: The Life and Music of Elvis Costello can be your answer because it can be read
by an individual who have those short free time problems.

Jeanie Clark:

Is it an individual who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Complicated Shadows: The Life and
Music of Elvis Costello can be the response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are therefore out
of date, spending your free time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these
guides have than the others?
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