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Want to know who is covertly manipulating the financial markets behind the scenes? Then follow the
money!

INTERNATIONAL BANKSTER$: The Global Banking Elite Exposed and the Case for Restructuring
Capitalism, by novelists, filmmakers and independent researchers James Morcan & Lance Morcan, identifies
who is responsible for the gigantic financial gulf that separates the top 1% of the population from the
common people, or the 99%.

The financial overlords illuminated in this book include the powerbrokers at Wall Street banks, European
central banks, the US Federal Reserve and the Vatican Bank, as well as elite banking dynasties such as the
Rothschild and Rockefeller families.

INTERNATIONAL BANKSTER$ discloses the real reasons for the series of recent financial crises. These
reasons include: the secret world of “black money” and Old World money where most assets and income
remain undeclared; the central banking system and the true nature of the Federal Reserve; the less-than-holy
financial activities of the Vatican; the IMF and World Bank’s sometimes less-than-charitable dealings with
the Third World; the austerity measures currently being inflicted on vulnerable nations like Greece; as well
as the theory that the world’s money supply is essentially being created out of thin air.

Beyond identifying the problems and exposing corruption, INTERNATIONAL BANKSTER$ proposes
ideas for creating a fairer economic system. These ideas include: publicly owned banks; utilizing certain
aspects of Islamic banking which may be compatible with Western banking systems; exploring whether
capitalism and socialism can actually work in tandem; arguing the case to maintain but restructure
capitalism; considering the merits of a universal income; and predicting how cybermoney, or
cryptocurrencies, will influence the world economy in the coming years.

Though the subjects covered may be monetary issues, that’s on the surface only. In reality, they are
humanitarian issues. As the authors state in the book’s opening pages, “Starving the masses of financial
opportunities, sinking them in debt and cheating them out of various services their taxes should pay for, are
among the greatest sins those in power can commit.”

As governments around the world continue to bail out privately-owned banking institutions ahead of
rescuing the millions of citizens facing bankruptcy and eviction from their homes, INTERNATIONAL
BANKSTER$ is a timely read.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Glass:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each data they get. How individuals to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information especially this INTERNATIONAL
BANKSTER$: The Global Banking Elite Exposed and the Case for Restructuring Capitalism (The
Underground Knowledge Series Book 5) book because this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of
course the details in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

John Lee:

This INTERNATIONAL BANKSTER$: The Global Banking Elite Exposed and the Case for Restructuring
Capitalism (The Underground Knowledge Series Book 5) are usually reliable for you who want to become a
successful person, why. The main reason of this INTERNATIONAL BANKSTER$: The Global Banking
Elite Exposed and the Case for Restructuring Capitalism (The Underground Knowledge Series Book 5) can
be one of the great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple reading through food
but feed a person with information that possibly will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is
definitely handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed
ones. Beside that this INTERNATIONAL BANKSTER$: The Global Banking Elite Exposed and the Case
for Restructuring Capitalism (The Underground Knowledge Series Book 5) forcing you to have an enormous
of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day
exercise. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Luis Gray:

The e-book with title INTERNATIONAL BANKSTER$: The Global Banking Elite Exposed and the Case
for Restructuring Capitalism (The Underground Knowledge Series Book 5) has a lot of information that you
can understand it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world currently. That is important
to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you within new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Yasmin Parker:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. That book INTERNATIONAL BANKSTER$: The Global Banking
Elite Exposed and the Case for Restructuring Capitalism (The Underground Knowledge Series Book 5) was
colorful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book INTERNATIONAL
BANKSTER$: The Global Banking Elite Exposed and the Case for Restructuring Capitalism (The



Underground Knowledge Series Book 5) has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until youngsters. For
example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and think you are the character on there.
Therefore not at all of book are make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to
choose the best book for you and try to like reading which.
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