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The search for wisdom invariably leads us back to the places we've overlooked.

The Little Red Book of Wisdom takes the reader on a journey so often sidestepped in favor of the newer,
quicker, easier.  If you're seeking simplicity in a complicated world, Mark DeMoss's insights will illuminate
your path to a wiser and more deliberate way of living.  By illuminating the notions of integrity, humility,
and self-restraint, DeMoss demonstrates what is possible when we value listening and thinking over talking
and doing.

Learn why a postage stamp is worth much more than 44 cents, and what time of day wisdom flourishes.●

Find out the wisest decision anyone can make, and the value of eating lunch alone.●

Rethink the advantages of technology, and learn how to safeguard yourself against any shadow of deathbed●

regret.

Step out of the incessant business of your daily life, and spend a few moments learning timeless and
foolproof truths that you can apply right away. Wisdom is not just for past generations; it calls to us today.
 We need only respond.
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From reader reviews:

Vanesa Thomas:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try to and must have the spare time or they will get lots of
stress from both way of life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely without
a doubt. People is human not really a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are there when the
spare time coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading ebooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the book you have read will be
The Little Red Book of Wisdom.

Ruben Martin:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a publication we can
know everything we wish. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
had been exactly added. This guide The Little Red Book of Wisdom was filled about science. Spend your
spare time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has diverse feel when they
reading any book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a publication. In
the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Ellen Jorge:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got students? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you know that
little person including reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the point. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update with regards to something by book. A
substantial number of sorts of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is actually The
Little Red Book of Wisdom.

Daniel Hutchison:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is published or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of news. With
this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social such as newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
searching for the The Little Red Book of Wisdom when you needed it?
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