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Design, implement, and publish custom Splunk applications and add-ons following best practices

About This Book

Learn advanced data enrichment techniques and create stunning data visualizations within Splunk●

Package and publish custom written apps for Splunk●

A step-by-step guide to Splunk application development with hands-on examples●

Who This Book Is For

If you are a Splunk user and want to enter the wonderful world of Splunk application development, then this
book is for you. Some experience with Splunk, writing searches, and designing basic dashboards is expected.

What You Will Learn

Implement modular input and a custom D3 data visualization●

Create a directory structure and set view permissions●

Create a search view and a dashboard view using advanced XML modules●

Enhance your application using event types, tags, and macros●

Package a Splunk application using best practices●

Publish a Splunk application to the Splunk Community●

In Detail

This book will equip you with all the necessary information to make the jump from a regular Splunk user to
an efficient Splunk application developer. It will give you an overview of Splunk applications and covers the
underpinnings of the structure and configurations that are contained within a Splunk application. You will
learn about the design fundamentals of a Splunk application, create a directory structure for your application,
and set view permissions. You will also see how to enhance your application using event types, tags, and
macros.

By the end of this book, you'll have learned how to implement advanced data input and visualizations, and
how to package and publish applications ready to deliver meaningful insights so you make better design
decisions for your business.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Endsley:

This Splunk Developer's Guide book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands.
The benefit you have by reading this book is definitely information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you
will get details which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. This kind of Splunk
Developer's Guide without we recognize teach the one who reading it become critical in imagining and
analyzing. Don't be worry Splunk Developer's Guide can bring when you are and not make your bag space or
bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even cellphone. This Splunk
Developer's Guide having great arrangement in word and layout, so you will not experience uninterested in
reading.

Doris Cobb:

The knowledge that you get from Splunk Developer's Guide is a more deep you looking the information that
hide in the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to be
aware of but Splunk Developer's Guide giving you buzz feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their
point in selected way that can be understood by simply anyone who read the item because the author of this
publication is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your vocabulary increase well. Making it
easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly
recommend you for having this specific Splunk Developer's Guide instantly.

Charlotte Neville:

This book untitled Splunk Developer's Guide to be one of several books that will best seller in this year, that
is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this book in
the book retail outlet or you can order it via online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes
you easier to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to you
personally to past this reserve from your list.

Christopher Dixon:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It fine you
can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Splunk Developer's Guide
which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.
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