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Gwen Shamblin, New York Times best-selling author of The Weigh Down Diet releases the highly
anticipated 440-page hardback book History of the Love of God, Volume II: A Love More Ancient Than
Time that will change your perspective on life and your purpose forever and will affect how you parent, who
you are in the workplace, and how you treat your spouse and loved ones. During the book's pre-release, a
select group was asked to help review the book. So many personal testimonies from this group began to pour
into Gwen's personal phone and the office about how their lives were forever changed that a webpage was
set up to chronicle these testimonies (http://gwenshamblinbooks.com/history-of-the-love-of-god/). Imagine
walking through difficult relationship situations, reviving marriages that seem over, work challenges, losing
the desire to overeat, drink or medicate, and solving seemingly insurmountable parenting issues with God's
perspective...with love. Through this book, you will feel and realize a love for God which is so deep it
changes the very motive of your heart. From the Bible, we know that God commands us to love Him first,
then love our neighbor as ourselves...but what does this really mean, and how do we apply it in our lives?
Penned from Gwen's own experience and decades of teaching seekers how to have a relationship with the
Father, this book is a beautiful and inspiring writing that starts with a history of God's love for man and
mankind's appropriate love back to the Father, then explains how this True Love can overflow into love for
those around you (even the unlovable)! A Love More Ancient Than Time will move your heart to a deeper
true love for God, a greater appreciation for Christ and more compassion for your fellow man!
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From reader reviews:

Diane Williams:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Close to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A publication History of the Love of God, Volume
II: A Love More Ancient than Time will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel much more
confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think in which open or reading a new book
make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you searching for best book
or acceptable book with you?

Wanda Crane:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be revise about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe
will update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming to
an individual is you don't know what one you should start with. This History of the Love of God, Volume II:
A Love More Ancient than Time is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this book
serves what you want and need in this era.

James Robinson:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all right you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like History of the Love of God,
Volume II: A Love More Ancient than Time which is finding the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
observe.

Sara Pacheco:

As a university student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the
library or make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's spirit or
real their passion. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we
know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this History of the Love of God, Volume II: A Love More Ancient than Time can
make you feel more interested to read.
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