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An authoritative introduction to the world of professional gaming and casino management, from the
authorities on the subject, the faculty of the UNLV International Gaming Institute: Vincent H. Eade, Director
David J. Christianson, Dean William F. Harrah College of Hotel Administration

Contributing faculty members: Frank D. Borsenik Leslie E. Cummings Robert J. Martin John T. Bowen
Bernhardt Fried Andrew Nazarechuk Pearl Brewer Zheng Gu John M. Stefanelli Anthony N. Cabot Jim
Kilby

This is the book for anyone interested in pursuing or advancing a career in the gaming or casino industry, the
ideal reference for hospitality students as well as professionals. Completely up-to-date and reflecting current
academic and technological trends in the field, as well as the legislative developments permitting gambling
casinos in almost every state, The Gaming Industry:
* Covers the historical background and regulatory aspects of gaming
* Explores all facets of casino operations--from food and beverages to cage operations, auditing, marketing,
and reporting
* Examines the mathematics and utility analysis of gaming, including all newly introduced technologies and
related practices for gaming and casino operations
* And much more...
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From reader reviews:

Randy North:

The book The Gaming Industry: Introduction and Perspectives make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You
may use to make your capable far more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting
pressure or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make studying a book The Gaming
Industry: Introduction and Perspectives to get your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add
your own capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You may know everything if you
like open up and read a book The Gaming Industry: Introduction and Perspectives. Kinds of book are a lot
of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this e-
book?

David Barthel:

The book The Gaming Industry: Introduction and Perspectives can give more knowledge and also the precise
product information about everything you want. Why must we leave the best thing like a book The Gaming
Industry: Introduction and Perspectives? Wide variety you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim
that will book can give many details for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer together with
your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you could give for each other; you could share all of
these. Book The Gaming Industry: Introduction and Perspectives has simple shape but the truth is know: it
has great and large function for you. You can appear the enormous world by start and read a publication. So
it is very wonderful.

Maria Gray:

The publication with title The Gaming Industry: Introduction and Perspectives contains a lot of information
that you can study it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This kind of book exist new information
the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to
yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you with new era of the
the positive effect. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Shelia Tonn:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity along with family
or just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading
through a book. Ugh, think reading a book really can hard because you have to accept the book everywhere?
It ok you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like The Gaming Industry:
Introduction and Perspectives which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's view.
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