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Dark matter is among the most important open problems in modern physics. Aimed at graduate students and
researchers, this book describes the theoretical and experimental aspects of the dark matter problem in
particle physics, astrophysics and cosmology. Featuring contributions from 48 leading theorists and
experimentalists, it presents many aspects, from astrophysical observations to particle physics candidates,
and from the prospects for detection at colliders to direct and indirect searches. The book introduces
observational evidence for dark matter along with a detailed discussion of the state-of-the-art of numerical
simulations and alternative explanations in terms of modified gravity. It then moves on to the candidates
arising from theories beyond the Standard Model of particle physics, and to the prospects for detection at
accelerators. It concludes by looking at direct and indirect dark matter searches, and the prospects for
detecting the particle nature of dark matter with astrophysical experiments. • Describes the theoretical and
experimental aspects of the dark matter problem • Presents observations, theory and experiments to give a
complete and consistent understanding of dark matter • Features contributions from leading experts in the
field
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From reader reviews:

Irma Patterson:

In other case, little individuals like to read book Particle Dark Matter: Observations, Models and Searches.
You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. Given that we know about how is important a
book Particle Dark Matter: Observations, Models and Searches. You can add information and of course you
can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can know
everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple thing until wonderful
thing you are able to know that. In this era, we could open a book or even searching by internet system. It is
called e-book. You may use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's go through.

Christine Frazier:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or that for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't desire do that. You must know how great along with important the book Particle Dark Matter:
Observations, Models and Searches. All type of book would you see on many options. You can look for the
internet resources or other social media.

Christine Erhart:

The event that you get from Particle Dark Matter: Observations, Models and Searches is the more deep you
excavating the information that hide within the words the more you get interested in reading it. It does not
mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Particle Dark Matter: Observations, Models and Searches
giving you excitement feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in particular way that can be
understood by anyone who read this because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This kind of
book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go
together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having that Particle Dark
Matter: Observations, Models and Searches instantly.

Siobhan Wilcox:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Particle Dark Matter: Observations,
Models and Searches e-book written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book which
can be understand by anyone who also read the book. Written in good manner for you, dripping every ideas
and producing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still doubt Particle Dark Matter:
Observations, Models and Searches as good book not only by the cover but also with the content. This is one
book that can break don't evaluate book by its protect, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick
that!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to one more
sixth sense.
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