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If you thought Evangelion's characters have a tough time in the anime, wait until you see what happens when
some of Japan's most unhinged manga artists get their ink-stained hands on them! Neon Genesis Evangelion:
Comic Tribute is an officially authorized one-shot anthology of parody stories assaulting Evangelion from all
directions.

Inside, Mine Yoshizaki (Sgt. Frog) leads a band of manga pranksters including Hideki Ohwada (The Legend
of Koizumi), Yun Kouga (Loveless), Nawoki Karasawa (Sake Jock, Super Cruel and Terrible Tales of
Manga-ka), Yoko Sanri (B Gata H Kei: Yamada's First Time), ComiPo! mastermind Keiichi Tanaka, Rui
Takato (Cynthia the Mission), Astroguy II (Queen's Blade Struggle), Kotaro Yamada (The Sacred
Blacksmith), Sessyu Takemura (Domin-8 Me!), Jun Abe (Portus) and Tony Takezaki (Space Pinchy. A.D.
Police). Also contains contributions from normal people, like Rikdo Koshi (Excel Saga).
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From reader reviews:

Nicole Marcil:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children till adult are different content. We all know
that that book is very important for all of us. The book Neon Genesis Evangelion: Comic Tribute has been
making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is rather
advantages for you. The guide Neon Genesis Evangelion: Comic Tribute is not only giving you a lot more
new information but also to be your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to
read your book. Try to make relationship with all the book Neon Genesis Evangelion: Comic Tribute. You
never really feel lose out for everything when you read some books.

Christopher Hill:

This Neon Genesis Evangelion: Comic Tribute book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is
in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book will be information inside this e-book incredible
fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This specific
Neon Genesis Evangelion: Comic Tribute without we recognize teach the one who studying it become
critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't end up being worry Neon Genesis Evangelion: Comic Tribute can
bring any time you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it in
your lovely laptop even phone. This Neon Genesis Evangelion: Comic Tribute having excellent arrangement
in word along with layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

William Glover:

This book untitled Neon Genesis Evangelion: Comic Tribute to be one of several books which best seller in
this year, this is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to
buy that book in the book store or you can order it through online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book
too. It makes you more readily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So
there is no reason to you to past this guide from your list.

Rose Heck:

The book Neon Genesis Evangelion: Comic Tribute will bring you to definitely the new experience of
reading the book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book you
just read, this book very suited to you. The book Neon Genesis Evangelion: Comic Tribute is much
recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can more easily
to read the book.
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