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One of The New York Times Book Review’s 10 Best Books of the Year

In this epic, beautifully written masterwork, Pulitzer Prize–winning author Isabel Wilkerson chronicles one
of the great untold stories of American history: the decades-long migration of black citizens who fled the
South for northern and western cities, in search of a better life. From 1915 to 1970, this exodus of almost six
million people changed the face of America. Wilkerson compares this epic migration to the migrations of
other peoples in history. She interviewed more than a thousand people, and gained access to new data and
official records, to write this definitive and vividly dramatic account of how these American journeys
unfolded, altering our cities, our country, and ourselves.
 
With stunning historical detail, Wilkerson tells this story through the lives of three unique individuals: Ida
Mae Gladney, who in 1937 left sharecropping and prejudice in Mississippi for Chicago, where she achieved
quiet blue-collar success and, in old age, voted for Barack Obama when he ran for an Illinois Senate seat;
sharp and quick-tempered George Starling, who in 1945 fled Florida for Harlem, where he endangered his
job fighting for civil rights, saw his family fall, and finally found peace in God; and Robert Foster, who left
Louisiana in 1953 to pursue a medical career, the personal physician to Ray Charles as part of a glitteringly
successful medical career, which allowed him to purchase a grand home where he often threw exuberant
parties.

Wilkerson brilliantly captures their first treacherous and exhausting cross-country trips by car and train and
their new lives in colonies that grew into ghettos, as well as how they changed these cities with southern
food, faith, and culture and improved them with discipline, drive, and hard work. Both a riveting microcosm
and a major assessment, The Warmth of Other Suns is a bold, remarkable, and riveting work, a superb
account of an “unrecognized immigration” within our own land. Through the breadth of its narrative, the
beauty of the writing, the depth of its research, and the fullness of the people and lives portrayed herein, this
book is destined to become a classic.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Rhonda Robitaille:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you might have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try factor that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are ride
on and with addition of information. Even you love The Warmth of Other Suns: The Epic Story of America's
Great Migration, you may enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of
hang-out type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout people. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its
known as reading friends.

Darcie Hartman:

The Warmth of Other Suns: The Epic Story of America's Great Migration can be one of your starter books
that are good idea. We recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that could
increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information.
The author giving his/her effort to set every word into pleasure arrangement in writing The Warmth of Other
Suns: The Epic Story of America's Great Migration however doesn't forget the main position, giving the
reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource information that maybe you can be one among it.
This great information can drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial pondering.

Karen Jude:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your limited time to read it because all this time you only find publication that
need more time to be study. The Warmth of Other Suns: The Epic Story of America's Great Migration can be
your answer given it can be read by you who have those short time problems.

Curtis Swasey:

The book untitled The Warmth of Other Suns: The Epic Story of America's Great Migration contain a lot of
information on the idea. The writer explains her idea with easy means. The language is very simple to
implement all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was authored by
famous author. The author provides you in the new era of literary works. You can easily read this book
because you can continue reading your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book with anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can start their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice
read.
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