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THIS IS NOT A FULL LENGTH NOVEL - IT IS NOVELLA LENGTH (about 20 thousands words). It is
1973. Eve and Janey, two young university students, are en route to a Bristol commune when they take an
unexpected detour to the little village of Midford. Seduced by the roguish charms of a young man who picks
them up in the village pub, they are astonished to find themselves at Asharton Manor, now the residence of
the very wealthy, very famous, very degenerate Blue Turner, lead singer of rock band Dirty Rumours. The
golden summer rolls on, full of sex, drugs and rock and roll, but Eve begins to sense that there may be a
sinister side to all the hedonism. And then one day, Janey disappears, seemingly run away… but as Eve
begins to question what happened to her friend, she realises that she herself might be in terrible danger…
The Rhythm of Murder is the third in the Asharton Manor Mysteries series: a four part series of novellas
spanning the twentieth century. Each standalone story uses Asharton Manor as the backdrop to a devious and
twisting crime mystery, from bestselling crime writer Celina Grace, author of The Kate Redman Mysteries.
Praise for Celina Grace from Amazon and Goodreads reviewers: “One of the best I have read this year. I
read about a fourth of the book early in the day, then at bedtime, I thought I would read a bit more before
sleep. I finished the book at 5:20 AM. Just could not put it down.” “…a gripping detective story but the main
character engages you, and as well as wanting to know how the mystery turns out you want to learn more
about her too.” “…amazing book, read it front to back in one visit, couldn`t help myself…” “…the most
enjoyable Kindle book I have so far read since the 'low cost electronic revolution' which has been sweeping
my reading habits for the last couple of years! Thoroughly recommended.” “This was my introduction to the
author, and I'm so glad I discovered the book. Well-written and a real page turner.” “I was awake till the
early hours to finish it !! I really enjoyed it and the characters in it so I'm pleased I also have the sequel
downloaded to read at some point. I know it should be great.” “Attention to detail and great character
building coupled with a mystery that keeps you guessing are all the ingredients that make me keep reading
till the early hours of the morning.” "Celina Grace has done it again, she compels you from page to page and
chapter to chapter, a great, riveting read..." "I found it difficult to put down and was completely distracted
from all the other things I should have been doing with my time." "This is a great series that I couldn't put
down and grabbed the next book right away at 1 a.m. to keep reading."
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From reader reviews:

Mary Parker:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be change about what going on or information even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era and that is always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming
to you is you don't know what kind you should start with. This The Rhythm of Murder: The Asharton Manor
Mysteries: Book 3 (Volume 3) is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because this
book serves what you want and want in this era.

Mary Banks:

The book with title The Rhythm of Murder: The Asharton Manor Mysteries: Book 3 (Volume 3) includes a
lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This kind of book
exist new expertise the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world now. That is
important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you inside new era of
the the positive effect. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you
want.

Jerry Thomas:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them loved ones
or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity this is look different you
can read some sort of book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the
whole day to reading a publication. The book The Rhythm of Murder: The Asharton Manor Mysteries: Book
3 (Volume 3) it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These people
were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can
buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not
too expensive but this book provides high quality.

Mildred Lucas:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
easier to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended for you is The Rhythm of Murder: The Asharton Manor Mysteries: Book 3 (Volume 3) this
book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This specific book was
represented so why is the world has grown up. The words styles that writer require to explain it is easy to
understand. The writer made some analysis when he makes this book. That's why this book suitable all of



you.
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