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Queer Insists is a memorial essay, a work of mourning, written for the queer theorist and performance
scholar José Esteban Muñoz (1967-2013) shortly after his untimely death in December 2013. In a series of
fragments, not unlike Roland Barthes’s Mourning Diary, Michael O’Rourke shares memories of Muñoz, the
stories and reflections of his friends in the wake of his passing, and readings of his work from
Disidentifications to Cruising Utopia and beyond. O’Rourke argues that, for Muñoz, queer does not exist, per
se, but rather insists, soliciting us from the future to-come. Muñoz reached towards teleopoietic worlds as he
invented a queer theory we have yet to find, but are invited to glimpse. Among the Muñozian themes this
chapbook discusses are hope, utopia, affect, punk rock, heresy, the undercommons, temporality, hauntology,
forgetting, loss, ephemera, partage, sense, incommensurability, the event and democracy. In reading Muñoz
as a Rogue Theorist, this book borrows many of the gifts we have received (and have yet to receive) from
him, marking the force and luminescence of his thought, and insisting upon the rare and precious singularity
of his work. Muñoz bequeaths to us a queer studies without condition which it is our duty to foster and to
bear as we carry it and him into the unknowable futures of an indiscipline.
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From reader reviews:

Teresa Propst:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. We all know that
that book is very important for people. The book Queer Insists: (for José Esteban Muñoz) seemed to be
making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is quite
advantages for you. The guide Queer Insists: (for José Esteban Muñoz) is not only giving you far more new
information but also being your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your
reserve. Try to make relationship while using book Queer Insists: (for José Esteban Muñoz). You never feel
lose out for everything should you read some books.

Paula Salas:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a publication will give you a lot of
new facts. When you read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of numerous ways to
share the information or maybe their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially fictional book the author will bring someone to imagine
the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When
you read this Queer Insists: (for José Esteban Muñoz), you could tells your family, friends and also soon
about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a e-book.

Donna Dalessio:

The book with title Queer Insists: (for José Esteban Muñoz) has a lot of information that you can understand
it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This particular book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to
know how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you in new era of the the positive
effect. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Edward Reed:

A lot of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half elements of the book. You can choose typically the book Queer Insists: (for José Esteban Muñoz)
to make your current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading proficiency is developing when you such as
reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the opinion about book and
studying especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to open up a book and examine it. Beside that
the reserve Queer Insists: (for José Esteban Muñoz) can to be your brand-new friend when you're truly feel
alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of this time.
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