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Why are there so few women in science? In Breaking into the Lab, Sue Rosser uses the experiences of
successful women scientists and engineers to answer the question of why elite institutions have so few
women scientists and engineers tenured on their faculties. Women are highly qualified, motivated students,
and yet they have drastically higher rates of attrition, and they are shying away from the fields with the
greatest demand for workers and the biggest economic payoffs, such as engineering, computer sciences, and
the physical sciences. Rosser shows that these continuing trends are not only disappointing, they are urgent:
the U.S. can no longer afford to lose the talents of the women scientists and engineers, because it is quickly
losing its lead in science and technology. Ultimately, these biases and barriers may lock women out of the
new scientific frontiers of innovation and technology transfer, resulting in loss of useful inventions and
products to society.
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From reader reviews:

Bonnie Fernandez:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Breaking into the Lab: Engineering Progress for Women in
Science. Try to stumble through book Breaking into the Lab: Engineering Progress for Women in Science as
your friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you experience alone and beside regarding course
make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you much more
confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , let me make new experience as well
as knowledge with this book.

Shawna Vaughn:

The reserve untitled Breaking into the Lab: Engineering Progress for Women in Science is the book that
recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to an
individual. The language that article author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author
was did a lot of exploration when write the book, and so the information that they share to your account is
absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Breaking into the Lab: Engineering Progress for Women
in Science from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Jeannette Coleman:

Breaking into the Lab: Engineering Progress for Women in Science can be one of your basic books that are
good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that can
increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information.
The author giving his/her effort to get every word into pleasure arrangement in writing Breaking into the
Lab: Engineering Progress for Women in Science yet doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the
hottest and based confirm resource data that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information
could drawn you into fresh stage of crucial contemplating.

Albert Fragoso:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year ended up being exactly added. This publication Breaking into the Lab: Engineering Progress for
Women in Science was filled concerning science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your
science competence. Some people has several feel when they reading any book. If you know how big
advantage of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like now, many ways to
get book that you wanted.
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