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On September 3, 1864, Union Major-General William Tecumseh Sherman telegraphed the War Department
in Washington, D.C., "Atlanta is ours, and fairly won.†? The capture of the heart of the south the day before
was the end of a fiercely fought four-month campaign in the Western Theater of the Civil War and caused
jubilation throughout the North. More importantly for the Union cause, it propelled President Abraham
Lincoln to reelection two months later.
In this volume author James Donnell explores the entire Atlanta campaign, from Sherman's initial clashes
with Joseph E. Johnston's army of Tennessee to the final Confederate resistance under General John Bell
Hood. Perfectly complemented by specially commissioned artwork and detailed maps, this study takes the
reader from the border of Georgia and Tennessee to Atlanta, with Sherman preparing for his famous March
to the Sea.
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From reader reviews:

Ruby Sprankle:

Now a day those who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each information they get. How a lot
more to be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book.
Examining a book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Atlanta 1864:
Sherman marches South (Campaign) book because this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course
the data in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Aubrey Smith:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information these days can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is in the former life are challenging be find than now could be
taking seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you obtain
the unstable resource then you buy it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take Atlanta 1864: Sherman marches South (Campaign) as
the daily resource information.

Scott Lowe:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to your account is Atlanta 1864: Sherman marches South (Campaign) this reserve consist a lot
of the information with the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how do the
world has grown up. The words styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer
made some analysis when he makes this book. That's why this book suitable all of you.

Paul Mendosa:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is
identified as of book Atlanta 1864: Sherman marches South (Campaign). You'll be able to your knowledge
by it. Without leaving the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is
most crucial that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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