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Romance was the last thing on their minds--until the holidays brought these two women face to face with the
men of their dreams. . .

Holiday Seduction Kayla Perrin

Mikki Harper isn't looking forward to going home for her sister's wedding--especially since she's just been
dumped. Then she runs into "Boring Barry" from high school and soon the two are catching up on old times-
-and Mikki discovers Barry is anything but boring. Mikki doesn't expect to see him again, especially not at a
dinner hosted by the groom's family. It turns out Barry wants to relive their fling. But will Mikki run into his
arms--or back to her ex, who's suddenly had a change of heart?

 Her Holiday Gifts Deborah Fletcher Mello

Commissioned to bake a towering cake for the Whitman Corporation's CEO at their New Year's
extravaganza--Malisa Ivey is mortified when she gets trapped inside. Even worse, the cake is then
transported--with Malisa inside--to Gabriel Whitman's office. The sexy business tycoon is shocked when a
beautiful woman pops out of his dessert--and can't help but wonder what it would be like to have such
sweetness in his life all year. . .
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From reader reviews:

Avis Zeiger:

The book All I Want Is You gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make
your capable a lot more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting stress or having big
problem together with your subject. If you can make studying a book All I Want Is You to become your
habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about a few or
all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like wide open and read a guide All I Want Is You.
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you
think about this publication?

Donald Murphy:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book
in comparison with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all this time you only find book
that need more time to be read. All I Want Is You can be your answer since it can be read by a person who
have those short spare time problems.

Richard Simpson:

You can get this All I Want Is You by browse the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it can to
be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only
by means of written or printed but also can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era such as
now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose
your personal ways to get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange you to
ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.

Robert Garcia:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It
is named of book All I Want Is You. Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it
might add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware
about reserve. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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