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For most English-speaking readers, Russian literature consists of a small number of individual writers -
nineteenth-century masters such as Dostoevsky, Tolstoy and Turgenev - or a few well-known works -
Chekhov's plays, Brodsky's poems, and perhaps Master and Margarita and Doctor Zhivago from the
twentieth century. The medieval period, as well as the brilliant tradition of Russian lyric poetry from the
eighteenth century to the present, are almost completely terra incognita, as are the complex prose
experiments of Nikolai Gogol, Nikolai Leskov, Andrei Belyi, and Andrei Platonov. Furthermore, those
writers who have made an impact are generally known outside of the contexts in which they wrote and in
which their work has been received.

In this engaging book, Andrew Baruch Wachtel and Ilya Vinitsky provide a comprehensive, conceptually
challenging history of Russian literature, including prose, poetry and drama. Each of the ten chapters deals
with a bounded time period from medieval Rus' to the present. In a number of cases, chapters overlap
chronologically, thereby allowing a given period to be seen in more than one context. To tell the story of
each period, the authors provide an introductory essay touching on the highpoints of its development and
then concentrate on one biography, one literary or cultural event, and one literary work, which serve as
prisms through which the main outlines of a given period's development can be discerned. Although the
focus is on literature, individual works, lives and events are placed in broad historical context as well as in
the framework of parallel developments in Russian art and music
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From reader reviews:

Alfred Cox:

The ability that you get from Russian Literature (PCHL-Polity Cultural History of Literature) could be the
more deep you digging the information that hide inside words the more you get interested in reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Russian Literature (PCHL-Polity Cultural History of
Literature) giving you buzz feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in certain way that can be
understood by means of anyone who read it because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This
book also makes your vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go with you, both
in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this particular Russian
Literature (PCHL-Polity Cultural History of Literature) instantly.

Jessica Hodgkins:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try and pick
one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its protect may doesn't work this is
difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer is usually Russian Literature (PCHL-Polity Cultural History of Literature) why
because the great cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint you. The inside or
content is definitely fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you
to pick up this book.

Millard Espinoza:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It alright
you can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Russian Literature
(PCHL-Polity Cultural History of Literature) which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this
book? Let's notice.

Dennis Jenkins:

In this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more precious than
other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you have to
do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to possess a look at some books. On the list of
books in the top listing in your reading list is actually Russian Literature (PCHL-Polity Cultural History of
Literature). This book that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning into precious
person. By looking right up and review this book you can get many advantages.
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