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 John Hodgman-bestselling author, The Daily Show's "Resident Expert", minor television celebrity,
and deranged millionaire-brings us the third and final installment in his trilogy of Complete World
Knowledge.

In 2005, Dutton published The Areas of My Expertise, a handy little book of Complete World Knowledge,
marked by the distinction that all of the fascinating trivia and amazing true facts were completely made up
by its author, John Hodgman. At the time, Hodgman was merely a former literary agent and occasional
scribbler of fake trivia. In short: a nobody.

But during an interview on The Daily Show with Jon Stewart, an incredible transformation occurred. He
became a famous minor television personality. You may ask: During his whirlwind tornado ride through the
high ether of minor fame and outrageous fortune, did John Hodgman forget how to write books of fake
trivia? The answer is: Yes. Briefly. But soon, he remembered!

And so he returned, crashing his Kansas farmhouse down upon the wicked witch of ignorance with More
Information Than You Require, a New York Times bestseller containing even more mesmerizing and essential
fake trivia, including seven hundred mole-man names (and their occupations).

And now, John Hodgman completes his vision with That Is All, the last book in a trilogy of Complete World
Knowledge. Like its predecessors, That Is All compiles incredibly handy made-up facts into brief articles,
overlong lists, and beguiling narratives on new and familiar themes. It picks up exactly where More
Information left off-specifically, at page 596-and finally completes COMPLETE WORLD KNOWLEDGE,
just in time for the return of Quetzalcoatl and the end of human history in 2012.
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From reader reviews:

Bruce Bracey:

This That is All book is just not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit
you will get by reading this book is usually information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get
info which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This kind of That is All
without we comprehend teach the one who studying it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't
always be worry That is All can bring when you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' grow
to be full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even cellphone. This That is All having fine
arrangement in word and layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Leslie James:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book can be option to fill your free time/
holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to
test look for book, may be the guide untitled That is All can be fine book to read. May be it may be best
activity to you.

Fern Gooding:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try and pick
one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover may doesn't work this
is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer can be That is All why because the amazing cover that make you
consider regarding the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content will be fantastic as the
outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Donald Barber:

This That is All is new way for you who has fascination to look for some information because it relief your
hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still
having small amount of digest in reading this That is All can be the light food to suit your needs because the
information inside this book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books develop itself in the form which is
reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in guide form make them feel
tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is no in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find
actually looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book type for your
better life as well as knowledge.
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